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MINISTER FOR EMERGENCY SERVICES — PORTFOLIOS — NOT-FOR-PROFIT GROUPS 
5865. Mr D.T. Redman to the Minister for Emergency Services; Corrective Services: 
I refer to the engagement of “not for profit” groups in the delivery of government services in the State, and ask: 
(a) For each of the portfolios under the Minister’s responsibility can the Minister outline the following: 

(i) List the name of, and funding given, to regional “not for profit” groups for each of the last 
3 financial years; 

(ii) List the total resources paid to “not for profit” groups delivering government services for each 
of the last 3 financial years, broken down into regional and metropolitan areas; 

(iii) List those “not for profit” groups who have been dropped from providing services since coming 
to government in March 2017, broken down into regional and metropolitan areas; and 

(iv) For each of the “not for profit” groups who have been dropped from providing government 
funded services, list the basis for the decision to no longer fund them; and 

(b) Of the “not for profit” services that have been dropped from government funding for each of the last 
3 financial years, can the Minister outline whether the service has been brought “in house”, is no longer 
provided or is provided by another “not for profit” provider? 

Mr F.M. Logan replied: 
The Department of Justice advises: 
(a) (i) Refer Table A. 

(ii) Refer Table B. 
(iii) Refer Table C. 
(iv) Refer Table C. 

(b) Refer Table C. 

Table A: 

Fin Year 16/17 

Supplier Amount Funded 

AccordWest 975,247.16 

Anglican Diocese 127,870.68 

Anglicare WA 136,586.00 

Centrecare 1,038,439.32 

Communicare Inc 297,484.30 

Geraldton Resource Centre 806,540.45 

Hope Community Services Inc 1,999,842.22 

Life Without Barriers 968,900.95 

Mens Outreach Service 1,400,774.44 

Oasis Assembly of God Australian Christian Church 23,249.12 

One Tree Community Services 288,978.84 

Pilbara Community Services Limited 1,157,976.84 

Pivot Support Services 1,277,658.32 

Red Cross 132,055.82 

Save the Children Australia 385,842.34 

Shire Halls Creek 64,728.34 

Shire of Carnarvon 129,456.94 

Shire of Derby/West Kimberley 63,456.82 
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South West Psychology, Counselling & Training Services 314,605.06 

The Wirrpanda Foundation Limited 280,910.00 

Yaandina Family Centre Inc 85,842.34 

Youth Involvement Council 106,312.70 

Fin Year 17/18 

Supplier Amount Funded 

AccordWest 1,012,507.67 

Anglican Diocese 128,932.80 

Anglicare WA 440,789.75 

Centacare Kimberley Association Inc 425,000.00 

Centrecare 984,520.80 

Communicare Inc 139,438.36 

Geraldton Resource Centre 656,793.84 

Hope Community Services Inc 2,439,264.93 

Life Without Barriers 887,273.00 

Mens Outreach Service 1,059,301.08 

Oasis Assembly of God Australian Christian Church 23,442.96 

One Tree Community Services 218,533.14 

Palmerston Association 83,375.00 

Pilbara Community Services Limited 1,175,691.90 

Pivot Support Services 1,304,987.73 

Red Cross 213,945.75 

Save the Children Australia 715,805.80 

South West Psychology, Counselling & Training Services 179,774.32 

The Wirrpanda Foundation Limited 185,720.00 

Fin Year 18/19 

Supplier Amount Funded 
AccordWest 1,100,000.00 

Anglican Diocese 130,448.85 

Anglicare WA 1,350,000.00 

Centacare Kimberley Association Inc 1,700,000.00 

Centrecare 900,000.00 

Hope Community Services Inc 2,944,867.33 

Life Without Barriers 479,848.00 

Oasis Assembly of God Australian Christian Church 23,718.59 

Palmerston Association 333,500.00 

Pilbara Community Services Limited 1,200,000.00 

Pivot Support Services 900,000.00 

Regional Alliance West 855,783.00 

Save the Children Australia 813,090.00 

The Wirrpanda Foundation Limited 24,500.00 
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Table B 

Fin Year 16/17 

Supplier Amount Funded 
Regional 12,062,759.00 

Metropolitan 17,105,014.20 

Fin Year 17/18 

Supplier Amount Funded 

Regional 12,275,098.83 

Metropolitan 16,912,709.07 

Fin Year 18/19 

Supplier Amount Funded 

Regional 12,755,755.77 

Metropolitan 19,277,844.71 

Table C 

Fin Year 16/17 

Supplier Basis for no longer funded Service Has been 

Regional 
Geraldton Streetwork Aboriginal 
Corporation 

Retendered – No Bid Provided as a subcontractor 

Mens Outreach Service Retendered – Unsuccessful Provided by new NFP provider 

Ngnowar Aerwah Aboriginal 
Corporation 

Retendered – No Bid 
 

One Tree Community Services Retendered – Unsuccessful Provided by new NFP provider 

Red Cross Retendered – Unsuccessful Provided by new NFP provider 

Shire Halls Creek Retendered – Unsuccessful Provided by new NFP provider 

Shire of Carnarvon Retendered – No Bid 
 

Shire of Derby/West Kimberley Retendered – No Bid 
 

South West Psychology, 
Counselling & Training Services 

Retendered – No Bid 
 

Yaandina Family Centre Inc Retendered – No Bid 
 

Youth Involvement Council Retendered – No Bid 
 

Metropolitan 

City of Cockburn Retendered – No Bid 
 

Fairbridge Western Australia Inc Retendered – No Bid 
 

Holyoake Retendered – No Bid 
 

Ngala Community Services Retendered – Unsuccessful Provided by new NFP provider 

Outcare Inc Retendered – Unsuccessful Provided by new NFP provider 

Swan Districts Football Club – V 
Swans 

Retendered – Unsuccessful Provided by new NFP provider 

WA Council on Addictions Retendered – No Bid 
 

Women’s Health and Family 
Service 

Retendered – No Bid 
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YMCA Retendered – Unsuccessful Provided by new NFP provider 

Fin Year 17/18 

Supplier Basis for no longer funded Service Has been 

Regional 

No Changes 

Metropolitan 

No Changes 

Fin Year 18/19 

Supplier Basis for no longer funded Service Has been 

Regional 

No Changes 

Metropolitan 

No Changes 

The Department of Fire and Emergency Services advises: 

(a)–(b) SES, VMRS and FES Units are authorised under the Fire and Emergency Services Act 1998 and fire 
brigades are established under the Fire Brigades Act 1942 to perform functions under those Acts for the 
State and have not been included in this answer. 

The Supervised Release Review Board advises: 
The SRRB does not contract any not-for-profit services. 

The Office of the Inspector of Custodial Services advises: 
(a) Not applicable. 

(b) Not applicable. 
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